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1 Here the West is used to denote the United States, 
the European Union, EU member states, 
and NATO. 

2 Mainstream media publications such as The 
Economist, Time, Foreign Affairs, and Foreign Policy, 
among others, have all published articles predicting a 
further cooling of the West-Russia relationship. 



 

 

                                                           
3 A security architecture is defined by Tow and Taylor 
(2010, 96)  as an “overarching, coherent and 
comprehensive security structure for a geographically-

defined area, which facilitates the resolution of that 
region’s policy concerns and achieves its security 
objectives.” 



 

 



 

 

                                                           
4 Incidentally, at the 1989 Malta Summit, the West and 
the Soviet Union tentatively agreed a post-Cold War 
security architecture for Eurasia which balanced 
power on the continent; a situation where both sides 
agreed not to pursue any hegemonic goals. However, 
when the Soviet Union collapsed in 1991, this security 

agreement was abandoned and the West – through its 
two main European institutions, the EU and NATO – 
asserted a normative, economic and security 
hegemony over Eurasia, at the expense of the largest 
country, Russia.  



 

 



 

 

                                                           
5 David Lake (2009, 61), in his assessment of the 
different types of regional security complexes argues 
that the most unstable is a bipolar regional setting, 
especially one which has no agreed security 

architecture, which makes the region “highly 
competitive and conflict prone.”  
6 The VJTF currently comprises four battalions 
stationed in Estonia, Latvia, Lithuania and Poland.  



 

 

                                                           
7 The Cold War became a globally significant contest 
largely because it involved the two clear poles of a 
bipolar international setting. While the West-Russia 
relationship could return to similar levels of 

antagonism, the global setting (now an emerging 
multipolar world) has changed significantly, especially 
with the Rise of China and India and Russia’s terminal 
decline (Smith, 2017b).  



 

 

                                                           
8 Although, in reality, Finlandisation was a begrudging 
bandwagon of the Soviet Union by Finland more than 

a coherent agreement by the United States and the 
Soviet Union (Walt, 1985).  



 

 

                                                           
9 Wohlforth and Zubok (2017) outline in more detail 
the steps which would have to be taken by the West 

and Russia to enable a pragmatic compromise 
between the two.  



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 


